PROCEEDING OF THE BOARD OF MEADE COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

January 5, 2010

The Board of Meade County Commissioners met in regular session on January 5, 2010, at 8:30 a.m., with Robert Mallow, Dayle Hammock, Alan Aker, Doreen Creed, and Gary Cammack present.  

The Meade County Commission led the group of Department Heads in the Pledge of Allegiance.


Department Heads met with the Board to discuss office matters.  


Meade County Commission Chairman Robert Mallow passed the gavel to Meade County Auditor Lisa Schieffer.  Organization for the Board of Meade County Commission took place for the ensuing year.  


Motion was made by Hammock, seconded by Cammack, to nominate Robert Mallow for Chairman of the Meade County Commission for 2010.   Motion was made by Hammock, seconded by Cammack, that nominations cease and that Robert Mallow be nominated under a unanimous ballot to be Chairman of the Meade County Commission for 2010.    Voting yes:  Mallow, Hammock and Cammack.  Abstaining:  Creed and Aker.  Motion carried.


The gavel was then passed back to Chairman Robert Mallow.


Motion was made by Hammock to nominate Gary Cammack for Vice-Chairman of the Meade County Commission for 2010.  The gavel was then passed to Vice-Chairman Hammock and Chairman Mallow seconded the motion.   Motion was made by Hammock that nominations cease and that Gary Cammack be nominated under a unanimous ballot to be Vice-Chairman of the Meade County Commission for 2010.   The gavel was then passed to Vice-Chairman Hammock and Chairman Mallow seconded the motion.   Voting yes:  Mallow, Hammock and Cammack.  Abstaining:  Creed and Aker.  Motion carried.


Motion was made by Aker to change the Planning Board Bylaws to read from seven members to five members.  Discussion took place on the legalities of the same.  The Bylaws will be taken to Meade County Deputy State’s Attorney Ken Chleborad for review.    Motion was withdrawn by Aker.  


Motion was made by Hammock, seconded by Aker, all Commissioners voted yes to approve the following Committee Appointments and Commissioner Liaisons:

COMMITTEE APPOINTMENTS FOR 2010

Black Hills Council of Local Governments


Representative - Dayle Hammock








Alternate - Alan Aker

Weed and Pest Board




Commissioner Member – Gary Cammack 

Three (3) year term




Leonard Lull (term ends 12/31/10)
2011







Kenneth Lee (term ends 12/31/10)
2011







Terry Hotchkiss (term ends 12/31/10) 2011







Dave Fischbach (term ends 12/31/11) 2012 

Resource & Conservation Development RC&D

Representative - Alan Aker








Alternate - Dayle Hammock

Juvenile Detention Center




Representative - Bob Mallow








 Ron Merwin

Senior Citizens Advisory Liaison



Sturgis – Doreen Creed








Faith – Gary Cammack








Piedmont – Alan Aker

Planning Board





Commissioner Member - Bob Mallow       

Five (5) year term




Alternate – Alan Aker

Tim Potts (term ends 12/31/10)
2011

Robert Powles (term ends 12/31/12) 2013

Craig Shaver (term ends 12/31/12)
2013

Wayne Gutzmer (term ends 12/31/13) 2014

Extension Board





Commissioner Member - Bob Mallow








Alternate - Dayle Hammock








Charlie Cresalia (term ends 12/31/11) 2012








Vonnie Ackerman (term ends12/31/11) 2012








Carol Oedekoven (term ends 12/31/13) 2014








Brett Hanson (term ends 12/31/10) 2011








ConnieMcPherson(term ends12/31/12) 2013








Kelly Keffeler (term ends 12/31/13) 2014

Joint Fire/Ambulance Hazmat/Communications Committee
Commissioner Member - Dayle Hammock







Commissioner Member – Bob Mallow







City Representatives








Sherrie Scudder








Tom Ferguson








Roger Call








Jim Bush/Ron Koan   

Campground Committee




Bob Mallow








Alan Aker








Rhea Crane

Faith Stock Show





Gary Cammack








Arlie Hulm - President








Paul Delbridge
Meade County Fair Board




Gary Cammack








Kathy Fredrickson - President

Stacy Hadrick

Meade County Housing & Redevelopment 


Brett Lynass (term ends 12/31/14)
2015

Five (5) year term




Robert Powles (term ends 12/31/012) 2013








Robert Guay (term ends 12/31/13)
2014







Barry Furze (term ends 12/31/10)
2011








Linda Lensegrav (term ends 12/31/11) 2012

Elk Creek Conservation




Commissioner Member – Gary Cammack

Tri County Conservation




Commissioner Member – Gary Cammack

Sturgis Chamber of Commerce



Representative Doreen Creed

Community Action




Connie Burditt








Curtis Nupen

Prairie Hills Transit   




Liaison – Doreen Creed

Resource Advisory Committee                                     
Chairman – Bob Heidgerken








Secretary – Anita Lee








Nancy Kile,Bill Kluck, Ed Thompson, 







Kenny Lee, Craig Shaver, Henry Bruch, 







Patty Booze, Kris Booze, Susan Maass








John DeYoe, Gary Deering 
                Metropolitan Planning Committee Executive            
Robert Mallow


Alan Aker
MPO Citizens Advisory Committee                                                  Ray Dvorak & Bob Burns

MPO Technical Coordinating Committee                                         Kirk Chaffee, Linda Rausch

Building and Security Committee                                          
Chairman – Kevin Forrester


Dayle Hammock, Doreen Creed, 


Jerome Eckrich, Jesse Sondreal,


Ron Merwin

Black Hills Vision            




Robert Mallow, Alternate–Doreen Creed                                                           

Meade County Transportation Committee


Gary Cammack, Dayle Hammock, Ken 







McGirr, 
Ron Merwin, Dan Staton DOT, Bill                    






Rich, Kirk Chaffee and Monica 








Heller (Liaison –Rapid City Planning), 






 
Linda Rausch
Sturgis Economic Development Corporation                          
Doreen Creed, Kirk Chaffee

Sick Leave Bank Committee                            
Doreen Creed                                  


                                                                             
Joell Romick


                                                              
Lisa Schieffer

Grant Committee
Lisa Schieffer


Joell Romick


Kathie Grant
Mental Illness                                                               
 Regular Members



Alan Stade (Term ends 12/31/2011) 2012                        
Pamela Kennedy (Term ends12/31/2011) 2012







Alternate Members


Dan Mayer   – (Term ends 12/31/2012) 2013

Salvador (Chuck)Valades(Term ends12/31/2011) 




2012

	2010 COMMISSION LIAISON
	

	
	

	Board Members - Liaison
	Office/Department

	
	

	Gary Cammack
	Highway

	Dayle Hammock
	Building/Maintenance

	Doreen Creed
	Auditor

	Bob Mallow
	Director of Equalization

	Alan Aker
	Treasurer

	Joell Romick
	Equal Opportunity Employment

	Dayle Hammock
	State's Attorney

	Doreen Creed
	Register of Deeds

	Dayle Hammock
	Sheriff

	Alan Aker
	Veteran's Service 

	Bob Mallow
	Extension Office

	Gary Cammack
	Weed & Pest

	Bob Mallow
	Human Resources

	
	



Motion was made by Cammack, seconded by Aker, all Commissioners voted yes to approve the minutes of the December 1st and 2nd, 2009 regular Board meeting, and the December 22nd, 2009 special Board meeting.  


Motion was made by Aker, seconded by Hammock, to set the rate of pay for the Meade County Commission at $24,000.00 per year and do away with the $125.00 technical allowance.  Voting yes:  Mallow, Hammock, Aker and Creed.  Voting no:  Cammack.


Motion was made by Aker, seconded by Cammack, all Commissioners voted yes to adopt the Meade County Times and Faith Independent as the primary legal papers of Meade County.

Motion was made by Hammock, seconded by Creed, all Commissioners voted yes to set the rate of pay for election workers as follows:


Fifty Dollars ($50.00) schooling;


One Hundred Twenty-five Dollars ($125.00) for Election Day;


Thirty-seven Cents (.37) per mile for mileage;


Ten Dollars ($10.00) if said election worker uses his or her phone for election purposes on the day 
of the election.


Rena Hymans, Attorney at Law, acting in capacity as a Board of Director for Wellspring Adolescent Treatment Facility, came before the Board to present information regarding the same.


Charles VanSickle came before the Board to discuss the Opal County Maintenance Shop.  He feels rent needs to be paid on the same.  Also present was Meade County Highway Superintendent Ken McGirr.  McGirr gave the history on the shop’s location.   The Board will get back to Mr. VanSickle about a definite abandonment date and McGirr will get numbers to the Board which was budgeted for a new building on the school property that was conveyed a few years ago.  


Motion was made by Aker, seconded by Hammock, all Commissioners voted yes to sign the Election Agreement between Meade 46-1 and Meade County for the primary election to be held June 8, 2010.    


Motion was made by Creed, seconded by Hammock, all Commissioners voted yes to approve the following resolution:  .


   MEADE COUNTY RESOLUTION
BE IT RESOLVED that the County of Meade hereby take action to include any official of the County of Meade, whether elected or appointed for a regular term of office or to complete the unexpired portion of any such term, hereby elect to treat such officials as employees for the purposes of including said officials for workers compensation coverage per SDCL 62-1-3 (4).

Dated this 5th day of January, 2010








/s/ Robert Mallow









Chairman, County Commissioners

Attest:/s/ Lisa Schieffer




Auditor

Motion was made by Cammack, seconded by Aker, all Commissioners voted yes to go into executive session due to personnel matters.


Motion was made by Hammock, seconded by Aker, all Commissioners voted yes to go out of executive session and return to regular session.

Meeting recessed at 12:00 noon for lunch and reconvened at 1:00 p.m.

Meade County Human Resource/Commissioner Assistant Joell Romick came to update the Board on human resource matters. 

Motion was made by Creed, seconded by Cammack, all Commissioners voted yes to reappoint Jerry Lolley to a term of 4 years as the Veterans Service Office in accordance with SDCL 33-16-24.  

Romick presented to the Board the quotes on the Sheriff’s liability insurance renewal.   Motion was made by Cammack, seconded by Creed, all Commissioners voted yes to accept the quote of Scottsdale for liability insurance in the amount of $24,591.00.


Discussion was had in regards to having a Commissioner representative sit in on the Department Head meetings.   The Department Heads felt that they could not talk as freely if a Commissioner was sitting in on the same and the constant rotation of Commissioners in on said meetings would not accomplish anything.  It was agreed that if the Department Heads want a Commissioner present at a meeting they will notify them of the same.


An all day planning/work session with Department Heads will be set for March 18th 2010 starting at 9:00 a.m.  


Discussion took place regarding a Commissioner Administrator.  Since time had ran out on discussion of the same, it will be discussed again tomorrow morning.  


Brett Burditt Meade 46-1 School District, Leslie Kaitfors, Paul Bisson, and Toby Morris from Northland Securities came before the Board to discuss earmarking the recovery zone economic development bonds.  It was asked that if the County was not going to use them would the Board sign over the stimulus bonds to the Meade 46-1 School District and sign a resolution regarding the same.  The agenda listed that the time and place of this meeting was to discuss helping finance senior living units.  Discussion will continue tomorrow regarding the resolution to sign over stimulus bonds to the Meade 46-1 School District.  


Motion was made by Cammack, seconded by Creed, all Commissioners voted yes to allocate the facility recovery zone bonds for the senior living unit in the amount of 2.7 million.


Motion was made by Cammack, seconded by Hammock, all Commissioners voted yes to go into executive session due to legal matters.


Motion was made by Cammack, seconded by Hammock, all Commissioners voted yes to go out of executive session and return to regular session.


Motion was made by Hammock, seconded by Cammack, all Commissioners voted yes to go into executive session due to contractual matters with Deputy State’s Attorney Ken Chleborad.


Motion was made by Hammock, seconded by Cammack, all Commissioners voted yes to go out of executive session and return to regular session.


Discussion was had regarding the road sign that was put up for the late Captain Soelzer.  Information was given to the Board that the US Postal Service will not deliver the mail to an abbreviated address.  


Motion was made by Hammock, seconded by Cammack, to spell out Captain (instead of abbreviated Cpt.) in regard to Captain Soelzer Street.  Said change is due to the US Postal Service not recognizing the same as an accepted abbreviation and deliverability matters.   Voting yes:  Mallow, Hammock, and Cammack.  Voting no:  Creed and Aker.  Motion carried.  Commissioner Creed asked that the record reflect that she is cantankerous over this matter.


Hearing was set for 4:00 p.m. for the Meade County Comprehensive Plan.  Meade County Deputy Director of Planning Bill Rich came before the Board to present the amendment to the Comprehensive Plan.  


Motion was made by Hammock, seconded by Aker, all Commissioners voted yes to approve the following Comprehensive Plan resolution:

RESOLUTION NO. 2010-02

A RESOLUTION ADOPTING AN AMENDMENT TO THE COMPREHENSIVE PLAN FOR MEADE COUNTY AS PROVIDED FOR IN SDCL 11-6

Whereas, 11-6-16 of South Dakota Codified Law has empowered the Planning Commission and the Board of County Commissioners to prepare a Comprehensive Plan and/or an Amendment to the Comprehensive Plan for the development of the County and

Whereas, the Meade County Planning Commission has developed an Amendment to the  Comprehensive Plan through the year 2035, has held the required Public Hearing, and has made a recommendation for adoption of the Plan Amendment to include the Meade County Transportation Plan as part as the Plan Amendment and

Whereas, the Board of County Commissioners has received the recommendation of the Planning Commission and has held the required Public Hearing; and

Whereas, the adoption of the Comprehensive Plan Amendment would enhance the future development of Meade County,

Now therefore, be it resolved by the Meade County Commissioners, that the Comprehensive Plan Amendment for Meade County be adopted.

ADOPTED THIS 5th DAY OF January, 2010

Publication Date: _________________

Effective Date: _________________

/s/ Robert Mallow________________    /s/ Lisa Schieffer_________________

SIGNED: Robert Mallow 


ATTEST: Lisa Schieffer - Auditor

Meade County, South Dakota


Commissioner Creed stated for the record “it is difficult for me to vote yes for this Comprehensive Plan as I object to many aspects of this imperfect document. I believe it is slanted. However, it is a step toward special zoning districts where we may get some corrections.” 


Meeting recessed at 5:30 p.m.   Meeting was cancelled due to inclement weather for Wednesday January 6th, 2010.


Meeting reconvened Thursday, January 7, 2010 at 8:30 a.m. with Mallow, Aker, Creed and Cammack present.  Commissioner Hammock absent.


Meade County Highway Department Superintendent Ken McGirr came to update the Board on Highway Department matters.  


Discussion took place regarding hold harmless agreements.  McGirr also updated the Board on 2010 Highway Department goals.  


Discussion took place regarding 131st Avenue.  The same was a review of the past meetings, regarding the same, under the highway department time.  


Motion was made by Aker, seconded by Cammack, all Commissioners voted yes to go into executive session for negotiations on 131st Avenue right-of-way.


Motion was made by Cammack, seconded by Aker, all Commissioners voted yes to go out of executive session and return to regular session.  


Bid letting was set for 10:00 a.m. for opening of fuel bids for FY2010 for the Meade County Highway Department.  Two bids were received as follows:






MG OIL



CBH Cooperative 

Transport Fuel:

ULSD #2 Dyed Red Diesel

2.0965



2.1063

ULSD #1 Dyed Red Diesel

2.3365



2.433

Tank-wagon Delivery

ULSD #2 Dyed Red Diesel

2.1645



2.1063

ULSD #1 Dyed Red Diesel

2.4045



2.433

Unleaded Gasoline


no bid



2.2767 + .06

10% Ethanol Unleaded Gasoline

no bid



2.2906 + .06

ULSD #2 Dyed Red Diesel (business hours)
no bid



2.1063 + .06

ULSD #1 Dyed Red Diesel (business hours)
no bid



2.433   + .06

Motion was made by Cammack, seconded by Aker, all Commissioners voted yes that due to the inability of the one bidder to accommodate all aspects of the bid, that the same be awarded to CHB.


Robert Heidgerken and Craig Shaver from the Resource Advisory Committee came to update the Board on committee matters.  Discussion was had regarding the Pine Bark Beetle Infestation letter.  


Motion was made by Creed, seconded by Aker, to approve adoption of that letter.  Motion was withdrawn.  Said letter having been approved at the December 2009 Commission Meeting.   


The Commission was given comments received by Anita Lee via email regarding the Ellsworth expanded training range.


It is noted for the record that the Board will reappoint Craig Shaver and Commissioner Hammock as representatives to the BLM Planning Meeting.


Motion was made by Aker, seconded by Creed, all Commissioners voted yes to set a first reading for revised Ordinance #34 - An Ordinance of Meade County, SD Providing Building Code and revised Ordinance #24 -An Ordinance of Meade County, South Dakota For the Placement of Billboards and Signs for February 3rd, 2010 at 4:00 p.m.  


Motion was made by Cammack, seconded by Creed, all Commissioners voted yes to approve the following abatements:

  
Leo Bestgen #01.07.A2 new value $70,512 due to portion of lot was sold to City of Sturgis;


Billy Martin #A1.17.11 new value $76,329 due to building be assessed on two parcels;


Stephen Zimmerman #14.50.08R new value $13,379 due to pole barn destroyed in fire;


Meade County #20.63.01.04 new value $16,844 due to property being tax exempt;


Sonny Lee Stotz #MH20.09.11 new value $0.00 mobile home moved off lot in 2007;


Pamela Gregor #20.53.10.05 new value $$110,088 due to house destroyed in a fire;


Motion was made by Aker, seconded by Cammack, all Commissioners voted yes that the Register of Deeds December 2009 Statement of Fees in the amount of Sixteen Thousand Four Hundred and Three Dollars and Seventy Cents ($16,403.70), as well as the Auditor’s Account with the County Treasurer be approved as follows:

AUDITOR’S ACCOUNT WITH THE COUNTY TREASURER

To the Honorable Board of County Commissioners Meade County:


I hereby submit the following report of my examination of the cash and cash items in the hands of the County Treasurer of this County as of January 1, 2010.

Total amount of deposits in bank




                46,121.12


Total amount of actual cash




  4,240.00

Total amount of checks and drafts in treasurer’s possession



not exceeding three days



               32,951.47

Itemized list of all items, checks and drafts which have been 



In the Treasurer’s possession over three days:



Postage & Exp.









CD’s & Savings




           1,800,000.00



First Western Bank Spec. Account


           1,489,166.71



Farmer’s State Bank




  6,316.45



First Trust





  1,754.35



First Western Bank Savings Account

           4,063,949.46



Insuff. Funds Checks




     113.33    







TOTAL

           7,444,612.89

Dated this 1st day of January 2010.

/s/ Lisa Schieffer, Meade County Auditor

 Meeting recessed at 12:00 noon and reconvened at 1:00 p.m.  Commissioner Hammock present.


Meade County Human Resource/Commissioner Assistant Joell Romick came before the Board to continue discussions on the new proposed Commission Administrator job description.  The Board took input from the Department Heads.  The Board will submit the same into a pending file until they are ready to address the issue again.


Motion was made by Aker, seconded by Cammack, all Commissioners voted yes to go into executive session due to personnel matters.  


Motion was made by Cammack, seconded by Hammock, all Commissioners voted yes to go out of executive session and return to regular session.

Meade County Director of Equalization Kirk Chaffee, Deputy Director of Planning Bill Rich, along with Jennifer Phillips, Planning Inspection II and Planning Secretary Shellee Kuper came before the Board to present plats and variances.


Motion was made by Hammock, seconded by Cammack, all Commissioners voted yes to approve the following variance:


Daniel Schuelke – renewal variance for a firearms dealership business on Lot 11A of Horseshoe 
Acres Subdivision 36-3-8.


Motion was made by Hammock, seconded by Cammack, all Commissioners voted yes to approve the following variance:


Larry Nelson – renewal variance for a gunsmithing business on Lot A of Lot 3 of Ponderosa Hill 
Estates in 12-2-7.


Motion was made by Creed, seconded by Hammock, all Commissioners voted yes to approve the following variance:


Linda Claussen – renewal variance for a photography business on Lot 5 of Creekside View Estates 
in 2-2-7.


Motion was made by Creed, seconded by Hammock, all Commissioners voted yes to approve the following variance:


Dolly Jo Bedford – variance for a daycare business on Lot 11, Block 1 of Borden Subdivision in 
7-2-7.


Motion was made by Creed, seconded by Aker, all Commissioners voted yes to approve the following variance:


Carol Sharp-variance for a daycare business on Lot 1 of Tract B of Borden Subdivision in 7-2-7.


Motion was made by Creed, seconded by Hammock, all Commissioners voted yes to approve the following preliminary plat:


Duane Robbins- Plat of Lots 46-51 of Horseshoe Acres Subdivision in the SE of 26-3-8. 


Motion was made by Hammock, seconded by Creed, all Commissioners voted yes to approve the following preliminary plat:


Stan  Scheurer- Plat of Lot 3R, Lot 1R, and Well Lot 1 of Seven Oaks Subdivision in the SESE of 
10-2-6 and the SWSW of 11-2-6.


Motion was made by Cammack, seconded by Hammock, all Commissioners voted yes to approve the following preliminary plat:


Jack and Joan Seymour – Plat of Tract 1 of Seymour Subdivision in the NESE of 23-6-5. 


Motion was made by Cammack, seconded by Hammock, all Commissioners voted yes to approve the following preliminary plat:


Lawrence Paule – Plat of Tracts 1, 2 & 3 of Paule Subdivision in Government Lot 4, 
W2W2SESW of 18-3-7. 


Motion was made by Cammack, seconded by Aker, all Commissioners voted yes to approve the following preliminary plat:


Jody Parker – Plat of Lots 11R, 12R, 16R and 17R of Marvel Mountain Estates in the SWSW of 
3-2-7.


Motion was made by Cammack, seconded by Hammock, all Commissioners voted yes to approve the following preliminary plat:


Gerald McFarland – Plat of Lots 3R, 4R and 6R of Royal Ranch Subdivision Phase I, Lots 52R-
55R of Royal Ranch Subdivision  Phase II, and Lots 7-19, 32-49, and 86-101 of Royal Ranch 
Subdivision Phase III in the NWSW of 16-3-9, NE of 17-3-9 and NENW of 21-3-9.


Rae Schneider came before the Board to present a notice of intention to add-omitted property.  Motion was made by Aker, seconded by Hammock, all Commissioners voted yes to approve the following add-omitted property:

Nancy Crowhurst #01.74.11.092 in the amount of $66,427.00  


Discussion was brought up by Chairman Mallow regarding the commission wage that they had approved on Tuesday.    Chairman Mallow passed the gavel to Vice-Chairman Cammack and made a motion to reconsider the following motion:


“Motion was made by Aker, seconded by Hammock, to set the rate of pay for the Meade County 
Commission at $24,000.00 per year and do away with $125.00 technical allowance.  Voting yes:  
Mallow, Hammock, Aker and Creed.  Voting no:  Cammack.”


Vice-Chairman Cammack passed the gavel to Commissioner Hammock to officiate, Cammack then seconded the motion.  Voting yes:  Mallow and Cammack.  Voting no:  Hammock, Aker and Creed.  Motion failed.  


Hearing was set for 2:45 p.m. for proposed vacation and relocation of section line.  Attorney Robert Haivala came, representing Warner and Delores D. Ghere, presented the petition.  Haivala would ask for approval of the same.


Gerald McFarland spoke in opposition of the same to Board and discussed passed history regarding the same.  


Motion was made by Hammock, seconded by Creed, all Commissioners voted yes to table the matter until February 2, 2010 at 3:30 p.m.   Motion was made by Hammock, seconded by Aker, all Commissioners voted yes to reset the hearing.


Motion was made by Hammock, seconded by Creed, all Commissioners voted yes to re-set the hearing for February 3, 2010 at 4:30 p.m.


Meade County Deputy Director of Planning Bill Rich came before the Board to discuss the proposed special zoning area around or near the City of Summerset.


Motion was made by Aker, seconded by Creed, all Commissioners voted yes to proceed with formation of special zoning district #1.  


Motion was made by Cammack, seconded by Creed, to have a public hearing set February 3, 10:15 a.m. regarding a stop sign on Pleasant Valley Road.  


Liz Larkin came before the Board to request a letter of support for the SEDC/RBEG Grant Applications.    Funding was also discussed for Rural Business Opportunity Grant.  Motion was made by Creed, seconded by Aker, all Commissioners voted yes to submit a letter of support for RBEG Rural Business Enterprise Grant.  

Motion was made by Aker, seconded by Hammock, all Commissioners voted yes to approve a letter being sent to Adjutant General Office Maj. Gen. Doohen thanking him for providing the color guard for the ceremony of the dedication of Cpt. Soelzer St.  

Discussion ensued regarding the earmarking of Recovery Zone Economic Bonds to help finance the Piedmont School.  Motion was made by Aker, seconded by Creed to allocate the remaining Recovery Zone Bonding to the 46-1 Piedmont School Building Project.   A substitute motion was offered by Cammack, seconded by Hammock, to allocate all but $500,000 of Meade County’s remaining Recovery Zone Bonding to the Meade 46-1 Piedmont School Building project.  Voting yes:  Mallow, Hammock and Cammack.  Voting no:  Creed and Aker.   Motion passed.  


THE FOLLOWING ARE DECEMBER 2009 RAISES: D Moore $18.87, J Urbaniak $11.59, D Crown $12.81, T Knight $13.19, S Bergman $16.92, K Varns $59703.00, B Pugh $16.25, J Olson $14.66
THE FOLLOWING ARE THE 2010 RAISES: R Mallow $24000.00, D Hammock $24000.00, A Aker $24000.00, D Creed $24000.00, G Cammack $24000.00, J Romick $59516.00, L Schieffer $54661.00, N Schneider $17.25, C Anders $17.00, M Larsen $14.50, S Boadwine $54156.00, S Huston $12.93, G Eixenberger $14.50, R Korth $13.96, L Bratland $16.12, E Asheim $15.87, S Harner $17.50, J Sondreal $84987.00, J Cooper $13.03, K Engel $50156.00, M Basker $13.42, T Munro $13.82, K Chleborad $65035.00, K Varns $60897.00, K Forrester $64641.00, M Buhler $12.18, K Lemmel $14.46, B Schwartz $13.56, B Petrocco $40181.00, W Pugh $16.58, K Chaffee $69986.00, S Kuper $13.96, C Swenby $13.56, G Hunt $43378.00, W Rich $51661.00, C Skinner $15.87, J Phillips $15.40, R Crane $50298.00, R Schneider $16.34, J Olson $14.96, C Smith $14.96, R Powles $100.00, W Gutzmer $100.00, C Shaver $100.00, D Deaver $49695.00, J Weischedel $13.96, R Gerving $12.18, L Cleland $11.48, K Andrews $12.08, J Lolley $38788.00, R Merwin $73948.00, C Averill $16.58, M Flesner $15.62, C Deyo $19.61, S Ford $14.50, C Williams $17.84, D Bostrom $17.84, B Lehrkamp $50298.00, R White $19.86, K Hubbard $17.08, R Benn $15.63, J Rhoden $18.62, V Gust $15.63, S Reimer $15.17, G Messner $14.73, S Johnson $17.84, R Nasser $14.73, Q Regan $16.81, C Johnson $49548.00, T Wilts $53911.00, D Moore $18.87, T Jensen $15.87, J Urbaniak $11.83, D Muller $41386.00, S Ulrich $11.48, C Dennis $14.95, H Beug $12.31, W McGee $12.49, C Aune $14.95, T Weiland $11.54, L Schmunk $12.31, J Price $15.89, D Aplan $12.86, K Rhoden $12.31, B Tveidt $16.25, W Shepardson $13.45, T Austin $13.86, T Gifford $11.15, M Droppers $16.04, L Anderson $13.45, G Mulder $13.18, J Peterson $12.18, M Vansickle $14.27, S Henderson $12.31, S Frickel $13.06, D Sulzbach $15.39, M Hendrickson $15.29, A Gifford $12.31, K Stansbury $12.31, L Keszler $15.37, C Alan $13.96, T Shoun $15.64, K O’Bryan $12.31, J Anderson $12.31, V Fitzpatrick $15.39, D Fish $15.39, K Hast $14.70, J Ruff $14.70, D Crown $13.06, T Knight $13.45, A Masden $13.06, K Grant $38038.00, N Jagim $44035.00, W Zuercher $15.79, M Hulm $16.12, W Reichert $15.62, C Cross $18.00, R Poelstra $28700.00, S Lensegrav $11.83, D Wicks $15.62, K McGirr $65785.00, B Severson $17.26, T Woods $17.26, S Bergman $17.26, G Harmon $16.03, C Oedekoven $16.03, G Keszler $16.03, L Lippert $15.57, L Jensen $15.11, D Fischer $14.88, J Garner $18.01, C Smith $18.01, J Hendricks $17.51, E Smith $17.51, E Thompson $18.01, G Hunt $17.76, D Meyer $17.76, C Hunt $14.67, E Bulau $17.76, R Scott $18.87, J Hostetter $17.76, D Berglund $17.51, S Barry $15615.00


THE FOLLOWING WERE NEW HIRES: 


THE FOLLOWING BILLS WERE APPROVED AND PAID:


ALLOCATIONS: Crisis Intervention $375.00, NH Alcohol $10000.00

SALARIES: Commissioners $5378.75, Auditor $12712.14, Treasurer $20248.20, States Attorney $27637.54, Maint $18707.11, Equalization $32377.51, Register of Deeds $12508.91, Vet Service $3172.67, Human Resource $5838.15, Sheriff $77444.50, Jail $70279.47, Coroner $1377.42, Dispatch $21859.82, County Nurse $4153.49, Extension $5391.90, Soil Conservation $2052.99, Soil Conservation $2689.50, Weed $6201.69, Highway $69552.71, Emergency Mgmt. $3110.17

SUPPLIES, SERVICE, EQUIPMENT: BH Chemical $62.20, R Mattox $315.00, Bob Barker $383.43, R Brennick $213.00, M Briscoe $300.00, Campbell Supply $4.49, Cardmember Service $3765.75, Cash-Wa Dist. $1655.20, City of Faith $61.95, Clinical Lab $1939.00, Creative Product Sourcing $424.60, Earthgrains $133.85, ESRI $1500.00, Extension Service $10.36, Faith Comm. Health Center $1200.00, V Fish $53.60, J Howell $3217.20, Jacobs Auto Repair $1659.68, KRCS $40.00, Lynn’s $18.79, D Marquette $1785.00, NADA Appraisal Guides $72.00, NW Pipe Fittings $556.91, Nyacor $32.99, Overhead Door $764.37, Pamida Pharmacy $93.00, Quill $472.54, Redwood Biotech $150.00, Rushmore Office $216.23, Sam’s $113.62, SDACC $2895.42, SDACO $2222.71, SD Public Assurance Alliance $1434782.47, SDML Workers Comp Fund $107367.00, Servall $22.88, Short Construction $734.40, US Foodservice $1469.59

MILES, MEALS, LODGING: Pizza Ranch $116.46, R Powles $20.72

COURT-APPOINTED ATTORNEY: B Flint $663.50, R Haivala $57.40, B Hubbard $2015.41, SDACC $3394.05, Stielow Law $527.70

MENTALLY HANDICAPPED: 


MENTAL ILLNESS: 


SUPPORT OF POOR: 


PUBLISHING: BHWG $48.74

UTILITIES: BHP&L $216.76, Butte Electric $149.04, Golden West Tele $579.35, Knology $1877.31, Midcontinent $59.67, Sturgis Water $1205.30, West River Electric $72.38

JURY FEES: M Bachand $50.74, T Bartlett $12.96, I Biers $21.10, M Birkeland $12.22, L Brabazon $15.54, J Breidenbach $101.48, L Clendenin $135.52, G Collins $124.00, C Dreyer $18.88, G Gentz $51.48, M Gruba $137.00, D Haskell $30.72, B Hawn $134.04, S Henderson $10.74, A Henry $188.80, S Hilton $129.60, B Johnson $11.48, K Jones $102.96, M Kehn $113.32, M Kimball $24.80, J Kok $50.74, A Konold $11.48, S Lettau $10.74, K Lindsley $69.24, R Lyons $11.48, D McRoden $10.74, R Nelson $128.12, R Parsons $52.22, K Plooster $68.50, R Price $10.74, K Quenette $65.54, W Rossow $51.48, B Schoonover $24.80, G Schut $25.54, D Smith $104.44, K Spring $47.00, W Tadlock $137.00, C Umphlet $24.06, L Wallace $10.74, C Whinery $11.48, J Wilson $10.74, K Wulf $203.60

VARIOUS FUNDS: Norwest Bank, matching Social Security $29,308.28, retirement System, matching retirement $25,791.26, county share of health and life insurance $76,041.42.

Motion was made by Cammack, seconded by Aker, all Commissioners voted yes to adjourn at 5:06 p.m.  






APPROVED:_________________________________








Robert Mallow, Chairman

ATTEST:__________________________


  Lisa Schieffer, Auditor

Published once at the approximate total cost of ______.
